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Ethan Leib: 
 
Ethan J. Leib is Professor of Law at Fordham Law School in New York.  His most recent 
book is Friend v. Friend: Friendships and What, If Anything, the Law Should Do About Them 
(2011), published by Oxford University Press. 
 
Linda Mulcahy: 
 
Linda Mulcahy is a Professor at the LSE. Her research focuses on the socio-legal dynamics 
of disputes and their resolution and she has received a number of grants from the ESRC, 
AHRC, Department of Health, Nuffield Foundation and Lotteries Fund in support of her work. 
Her most recent book, published by Routledge in 2011, examines the relationship between 
the design of the law court and due process.  Linda also has an interest in contractual 
relations.  She is the author of Contract Law in Perspective and Feminist perspectives on 
Contract. 
 
Roger Brownsword: 
 
Roger Brownsword is a graduate of the London School of Economics. He is Professor of 
Law at King's College London, where he was the founding director of TELOS (a research 
centre that focuses on technology, ethics, law and society); he is an honorary Professor in 
Law at the University of Sheffield; and he is a visiting professor at Singapore Management 
University. 
 
His interests span legal theory, regulation and technology, and the common law. His more 
recent books include (with Deryck Beyleveld) Human Dignity in Bioethics and Biolaw (2001) 
and Consent in the Law (2007); the edited volume, Human Rights (2004); Contract Law: 
Themes for the Twenty-First Century (2006); Rights, Regulation and the Technological 
Revolution (2008); and two co-edited collections, one on Regulating Technologies (2008), 
and the other on The Foundations of European Private Law (2011). His latest book (co-
authored with Morag Goodwin and in press with CUP) is Law and the Technologies of the 
Twenty-First Century.  In total, he has published some 200 papers. 
 
Jonathan Morgan: 
 
Jonathan Morgan is Fellow and Tutor in Law at St Catherine's College, University of Oxford, 
where he teaches contract, tort, constitutional and administrative law.  He previously taught 
a Law & Economics course at Cambridge University.  He is in the course of writing a book 
called Contract Law Minimalism: A Formalist Restatement (Law in Context, CUP).  His most 
relevant publication for the conference in memory of Ian Macneil is probably 'Against judicial 
review of discretionary contractual powers' [2008] LMCLQ 230." 

 


